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DIY Projects:

Half-Moon Painted Arch Headboard

Crate Nightstand

Boho-inspired Wreath

Pulling inspiration from the beautiful
vintage art-print and the colorful bohemian
rug, I chose Livable Green by Sherwin
Williams for the wall color, and Flora by
Benjamin Moore for the half-moon arch
headboard. This created a bedroom "zone"
within the studio apartment.

I built the crate nightstand and installed a
plug-in sconce - a perfect solution for
renters who need extra lighting. The lighter
stain on the wood complements the dark
flooring, and the use of raw materials fits in
with the desired bohemian design style. 
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DIY Projects:

Hanging Basket Light 

Wine Corkboard

Hanging a double curtain-rod with a
combination of white sheers and linen
drapes served the dual purpose of filtering
light and providing privacy. The chaise of
the sofa helped give this area of the studio
apartment a "moment" and the navy picks
up the details from the rug beautifully.
Rattan accents continue on the bohemian
feel.

Opposite the living room area is the office.
By using a ladder desk and thus, the
available vertical space in the room, we
were able to maximize the client's usability
without compromising the spacial footprint.
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A tiny kitchen can still make an

impact with intentional details, like

this hand-stenciled tile backsplash.

DIY Projects:

Hand-Stenciled Tile Backsplash

Kitchen Cart + Pegboard Install
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